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Pharmacy In Wishaw

Well Pharmacy - Wishaw
   
Understanding the Experience at Well Pharmacy, Wishaw

  Well Pharmacy in Wishaw has become a focal point for local residents seeking
pharmaceutical services. However, the experiences of customers vary
significantly. Here is a closer look at service options and accessibility at this
pharmacy.  

Service Options and Customer Experiences

  The pharmacy offers various **service options**, including in-store shopping,
repeat prescriptions, and **in-store pick-up**. Yet, customer feedback suggests
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major concerns regarding timely delivery and medication availability.   Many
customers have expressed frustration with **payments** and prescription
fulfillment, noting that their medications were not ready on time or were
incomplete. For instance, one user reported running out of essential heart
medication despite multiple follow-up calls, highlighting the importance of timely
service.  

Accessibility Features

  One positive aspect of Well Pharmacy is its commitment to **accessibility**.
The establishment features a **wheelchair-accessible entrance**, making it
easier for all customers to access the services they need. This focus on
accessibility is vital, especially for those with mobility challenges.  Additionally,
the pharmacy is noted for being **LGBTQ+ friendly** and a designated
**transgender safe space**. This inclusivity is an essential factor in promoting a
welcoming environment for all customers.  

Payment Methods Accepted

  Well Pharmacy accommodates various **payment methods**, including
**credit cards**, **debit cards**, and modern **NFC mobile payments**. This
flexibility enhances the shopping experience, allowing customers to choose the
most convenient transaction method.  

Customer Service and Community Feedback

  While some customers appreciated the friendly demeanor of the staff, others
reported serious shortcomings in customer service. Staff members were
described as helpful and kind by many, creating a pleasant atmosphere during
visits. Yet, there were complaints about staff not being attentive to the needs of
every customer, especially when busy with other priorities.  

Final Thoughts on Well Pharmacy, Wishaw

  In conclusion, Well Pharmacy in Wishaw provides a range of services aimed at
catering to the community's needs. However, customer feedback indicates
significant room for improvement, particularly in **delivery** times and the
overall efficiency of services. While the accessibility and payment options are
commendable, the key takeaway is the necessity for enhanced communication
and reliability in fulfilling prescriptions.  For those considering using Well
Pharmacy, it may be wise to weigh both positive and negative experiences
shared by the community before making a decision.    
Our business is found at

  
 80-82 Main St, ML2 7AB  Wishaw,  - United Kingdom  (GB) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of this Pharmacy  is +441698373136
 

2/6

https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=55.774427599999996%2C-3.9207900999999996#map=15/55.774427599999996/-3.9207900999999996
tel:+441698373136


And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+441698373136
 
    
 
   
    
 

Visit us during the following hours:

    Day Hours    Monday 8:30?AM–6?PM   Tuesday 8:30?AM–6?PM   Wednesday 8:30?AM–6?PM   Thursday 9?AM–5?PM   Friday Closed   Saturday 8:30?AM–6?PM   Sunday 8:30?AM–6?PM        The website is Well Pharmacy       If you wish to adjust any element that you feel is not precise regarding this
portal, please send a message so we can we will fix it as soon as possible. With
anticipation thanks. 

Images

Well pharmacy wishaw

3/6

https://wa.me/+598+441698373136
https://lloydspharmacy.com/
https://www.rajeunir.co.uk/img/well-pharmacy-wishaw_229206.webp


Well pharmacy street view 360deg

Well pharmacy pharmacy
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