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Pharmacy In Hamilton

Boots Pharmacy - Hamilton
   
Exploring Boots Pharmacy in Hamilton: A Comprehensive Overview

  Boots Pharmacy located in Hamilton serves as a crucial health resource for
many residents. With various **service options** and a focus on
**accessibility**, it accommodates the needs of its customers, including those
requiring a **wheelchair-accessible entrance** and a **wheelchair-accessible
car park**.  

Service Options at Boots Pharmacy

  Boots Pharmacy provides multiple **service options** to streamline your
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experience. Customers can benefit from **in-store shopping**, **in-store
pick-up**, and **delivery** services. For those in a rush or with mobility issues,
the **quick visit** option is particularly appealing. Additionally, the pharmacy
supports **NFC mobile payments** along with traditional **credit card**
payments, making transactions seamless.  

Accessibility Features

  Accessibility is a top priority at Boots Pharmacy. The **wheelchair-accessible
entrance** ensures that all customers can enter the pharmacy without
difficulties. Moreover, the **wheelchair-accessible car park** allows for
convenient access when arriving by vehicle, ensuring inclusivity for everyone.  

Customer Experience: Mixed Reviews

  Although many customers appreciate the **friendly and knowledgeable staff**,
there are notable concerns regarding customer service. Some patrons report
having **poor customer experiences**, specifically related to medication
availability and how staff address inquiries. Instances of long wait times and
miscommunication about prescriptions have sparked frustration among some
visitors.  Update: Despite these challenges, there have been instances where
the management addressed concerns professionally, showcasing a commitment
to improving customer satisfaction.  

Concluding Thoughts

  While Boots Pharmacy in Hamilton boasts a variety of services and
accessibility features, the mixed reviews highlight the importance of continuous
staff training to enhance customer interactions. Regular visitors can expect a
busy environment, but with patience and understanding, they may find the
pharmacy's resources beneficial for their health needs.    
You can find us at

  
 9 Mill Rd, ML3 8AA  Hamilton,  - United Kingdom  (GB) 
 
     
 
The contact line of the respective Pharmacy  is +441698421133
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+441698421133
 
    
 
   
    
 

Visit us during the following hours:

    Day Hours    Monday 8?AM–6?PM   Tuesday 
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https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=55.76063%2C-4.0475240999999995#map=15/55.76063/-4.0475240999999995
tel:+441698421133
https://wa.me/+598+441698421133


8?AM–6?PM   Wednesday 8?AM–6?PM   Thursday 9?AM–5?PM   Friday Closed   Saturday 8?AM–6?PM   Sunday 8?AM–6?PM        The website is Boots Pharmacy       In case you want to alter any data that you think is incorrect concerning this
web, we ask deliver a message and we will handle it promptly. Thank you in
advance we appreciate it. 

Images

Boots pharmacy street view 360deg

3/7

https://www.boots.com/stores/5259-hamilton-ml-road-health-centre-ml3-8aa?utm_source=google&utm_medium=organic&utm_campaign=LPM_google_5259
https://www.rajeunir.co.uk/img/boots-pharmacy-street-view-360deg_229262.webp
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Boots pharmacy hamilton
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