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Pharmacy In Dumfries

Rowlands Pharmacy Dumfries - Dumfries
   
Exploring Rowlands Pharmacy in Dumfries

  Rowlands Pharmacy in Dumfries is not just a place to pick up prescriptions; it
is a cornerstone of the community known for its exceptional service and
accessibility. Whether you require medication or expert advice, this pharmacy
stands out for several reasons.  

Accessibility for All

  One of the main advantages of Rowlands Pharmacy is its
**wheelchair-accessible entrance**, ensuring that everyone, regardless of
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mobility challenges, can access their services comfortably. The pharmacy's
commitment to accessibility makes it a welcoming space for all customers.  

Efficient Payments

  When it comes to **payments**, Rowlands Pharmacy understands the
importance of convenience. They accept various payment methods, including
**credit cards**, making transactions quick and hassle-free. This flexibility allows
customers to focus on their health rather than worrying about payment logistics. 

Quick Visit Experience

  Customers appreciate the **quick visit** experience at Rowlands Pharmacy.
Many have noted that there are no lengthy waits, which is often a major concern
in healthcare settings. One satisfied customer mentioned, “No 30-minute waits,
no eye rolls when you say you would like to wait.” This efficiency reflects the
pharmacy's commitment to providing timely and considerate service.  

Knowledgeable and Kind Staff

  The staff at Rowlands Pharmacy are frequently praised for being **kind,
informative**, and highly knowledgeable. Customers have expressed their
satisfaction with how the pharmacists take the time to listen and offer valuable
advice. As one patron said, “The pharmacist knows exactly what they’re doing
and can offer great advice.” Such professionalism ensures that every visit is not
only productive but also pleasant.  

A Community Gem

  Rowlands Pharmacy has become a valued resource in Dumfries. With its
commitment to accessibility, efficient payment options, and a dedicated team, it
is easy to see why customers hold this pharmacy in high regard. If you are in
need of pharmacy services in Dumfries, Rowlands Pharmacy stands ready to
serve you with excellence and care.    
We are situated in

  
 12 Castle St, DG1 1DR  Dumfries,  - United Kingdom  (GB) 
 
     
 
The phone number of this Pharmacy  is +441387262107
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+441387262107
 
    
 
   
    
 

We look forward to seeing you at:

    Day Hours    Monday

2/4
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concerning this portal, please deliver a message so that we will fix it promptly.
With anticipation we appreciate it. 
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