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Pharmacy In Carluke

LloydsPharmacy - Carluke
   
LloydsPharmacy in Carluke: Your Comprehensive Pharmacy Destination

  When you think of your neighborhood pharmacy, convenience and service
options are likely at the top of your list. At LloydsPharmacy in Carluke, you’ll find
an excellent combination of both.   

Delivery and Service Options

  LloydsPharmacy offers an array of **service options** designed to meet
diverse customer needs. Whether you're looking for **delivery** services or
**in-store pick-up**, this pharmacy has got you covered. Their efficient delivery
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system ensures that you receive your necessary medications directly to your
doorstep, making healthcare more accessible than ever.  

Accessibility for Everyone

  Planning a visit to LloydsPharmacy? Accessibility is a top priority. The
pharmacy features a **wheelchair-accessible entrance** so that all customers
can access their products and services easily. Additionally, the staff is trained to
provide support, making it a welcoming environment for everyone, including
being a **transgender safe space** that embraces diversity and inclusion.  

In-Store Shopping Experience

  For those who prefer **in-store shopping**, LloydsPharmacy is committed to
ensuring a pleasant experience. Customers have praised the **excellent
pharmacist** and the **friendly, knowledgeable staff** who go above and
beyond to make sure you have what you need. A quick visit here means you
can expect personalized care and advice tailored to your individual health
requirements.  

Payment Options for Convenience

  In today's fast-paced world, convenient payment methods are essential.
LloydsPharmacy accepts **credit cards**, **debit cards**, and even **NFC
mobile payments** to ensure that transactions are seamless. This flexibility
allows you to focus on your health rather than the hassle of payment methods.  

A Community-Focused Environment

  The atmosphere at LloydsPharmacy is friendly and inclusive, making it a hub
for the local community. Customers appreciate how the staff always makes sure
they have the medication they need. This commitment to **customer service**
creates a sense of camaraderie and trust among patrons.  Whether you’re
popping in for a quick visit or planning a more comprehensive shopping
experience, LloydsPharmacy in Carluke stands out as a premier choice for
pharmacy **service options**, accessibility, and community support. Enjoy
peace of mind knowing your health is in good hands.    
The premises are located at

  
 17 High St, ML8 4AS  Carluke,  - United Kingdom  (GB) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of the mentioned Pharmacy  is +441555771249
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+441555771249
 
    
 
   
    
 

We are open during the following hours:

2/6

https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=55.7346899%2C-3.8391442#map=15/55.7346899/-3.8391442
tel:+441555771249
https://wa.me/+598+441555771249


    Day Hours    Monday 8:30?AM–5?PM   Tuesday 8:30?AM–5:30?PM   Wednesday 8:30?AM–5:30?PM   Thursday 8:30?AM–5:30?PM   Friday Closed   Saturday 8:30?AM–5:30?PM   Sunday 8:30?AM–5:30?PM        The website is LloydsPharmacy       If you require to modify any detail that you believe is incorrect concerning
this page, we ask forward a message so that we will correct it at the earliest
convenience. In advance thank you very much. 
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Lloydspharmacy map

Lloydspharmacy carluke
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