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Convenience Store In Longniddry

Margiotta Aberlady - Longniddry
   
Margiotta Aberlady: Your Local Convenience Store

  Margiotta Aberlady, located in the picturesque village of Longniddry, is more
than just a convenience store; it’s a community hub that offers **top-quality
products** and friendly service. With a focus on **accessibility**, this store
makes it easy for everyone in the community to pop in for their daily needs.  

Accessibility Features

  The store boasts a **wheelchair-accessible entrance**, ensuring that all
customers, regardless of mobility, can easily access the range of products
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available. This commitment to accessibility reflects Margiotta Aberlady's
dedication to serving every member of the community.  

Payment Options

  Margiotta Aberlady caters to modern customer needs by accepting a variety of
**payment methods**. Whether you prefer using **debit cards**, **credit
cards**, or **NFC mobile payments**, shopping here is convenient and
hassle-free. The store provides a seamless experience with quick and efficient
payment processing.  

Exceptional Service Options

  Customers have described the staff at Margiotta Aberlady as the “friendliest”
they’ve encountered. They are always ready to assist, making every visit
pleasant. While some comments noted challenges in service speed during busy
times, the overall feedback highlights the cheerful demeanor and helpfulness of
the team. On weekends, be sure to check out Andreas's homemade fruit
scones—perfect for a **quick visit**!  

Delivery and Planning

  For those unable to visit the store, Margiotta Aberlady offers **same-day
delivery** for select products, making it easier for locals to enjoy their favorite
items without leaving home. This planning capability ensures that essential
goods are available when needed, enhancing the shopping experience for
everyone.  

A Diverse Range of Products

  Margiotta Aberlady is known for its impressive selection of local produce,
wines, and everyday essentials. Customers rave about the variety, including
delicious ice cream and pizza options. Regulars appreciate that they often
choose Margiotta over supermarkets for daily grocery needs, thanks to the high
quality of offerings.  

A Community Staple

  As many locals agree, Margiotta Aberlady is a “brilliant addition” to Aberlady. It
not only serves as a convenience store but also acts as a gathering place where
neighbors can catch up while shopping. The warm atmosphere, coupled with an
extensive range of products and efficient service options, makes Margiotta a
beloved fixture in the community.   In conclusion, whether you're stopping by for
a **quick visit** or planning to explore the delightful local selections, Margiotta
Aberlady is committed to providing excellent service and quality, all while
maintaining a welcoming environment for everyone.    
We are situated in

  
 10a High St, EH32 0RB  Longniddry,  - United Kingdom  (GB) 
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https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=56.0093111%2C-2.8613028#map=15/56.0093111/-2.8613028


 
     
 
The contact phone of said Convenience store  is +441875870742
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+441875870742
 
    
 
   
    
 

Our public attention hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 7?AM–8?PM   Tuesday 7?AM–8?PM   Wednesday 7?AM–8?PM   Thursday 7?AM–8?PM   Friday 7?AM–8?PM   Saturday 7?AM–8?PM   Sunday 7?AM–8?PM        The website is Margiotta Aberlady       In case you want to change any detail that you consider is not correct
regarding this page, please send a message and we will fix it quickly. Thanks
beforehand thank you very much. 

Images
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Margiotta aberlady longniddry

Margiotta aberlady inside
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